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Besides monomeric prolactin (PRL) at 23 kDa, additional 
fractions of human serum contain immunoreactive PRL, 
such as big-PRL (50 kDa) and big-big PRL (>150 kDa). 
These fractions comprise PRL dimers and/or multimers, 
and complexes of PRL and immunoglobulins of the immu-
noglobulin G (IgG)- and immunoglobulin A (IgA)-type, 
referred to as macroprolactin (1–3). Macroprolactinaemia 
is usually defined as PRL levels above the upper thresh-
old of the reference range due to the presence of Ig-type 
macroprolactin at normal levels of monomeric PRL. Thus, 
the presence of Ig-type macroprolactin can impact the 
measurement of monomeric PRL and cause false-high 
PRL levels, if not properly addressed by polyethylene gly-
col (PEG) precipitation. As neatly summarized recently by 
Michael N. Fahie-Wilson, there is widespread consensus 
that (a) macroprolactinaemia is common; (b) its clinical 
significance is its ability to produce false-high PRL lev-
els indicating hyperprolactinaemia of monomeric PRL; 
and (c) that it is biologically inactive in vivo (4). It has 
been concluded from clinical studies, including a lon-
gitudinal cohort study, that macroprolactinaemia is a 
benign condition with no pathological significance (5). 
Anti-PRL autoantibodies are the major cause of macro-
prolactinaemia, although other binding types have also 
been discussed (6). Much of the attention on macroprol-
actinaemia has been focused on its prevalence and meth-
odological issues (such as reducing the macroprolactin 
cross-reactivity of PRL assays) while investigating the true 
endocrine nature of macroprolactinaemia has received 

less attention. As demonstrated by the research of Naoki 
Hattori et al., major epitopes for anti-PRL autoantibod-
ies are located at the N- and C-terminal residues of the 
PRL molecule (7). The PRL–IgG complex increases the 
half-life of PRL in the circulation as it hinders renal 
elimination (8). Due to its size, it may prevent PRL from 
entering target tissues. Macroprolactin has been found 
in cord-blood and amniotic fluid (9) and can be detected 
in the serum of pregnant women (10). PRL may dissoci-
ate from IgG, regaining its full biological activity (11). In 
addition, a distinct group of individuals with normal PRL 
levels also have significant fractions of IgG-bound PRL, 
indicating that macroprolactinaemia can occur across 
the full range of circulating PRL levels. (6). Should the 
definition of macroprolactinaemia include these cases, 
and if yes, is there a clinical relevance? Given the absence 
of autoimmune disease in subjects with macroprolacti-
naemia, which is the true physiological origin and con-
text of anti-PRL autoantibodies? Does binding to IgG/IgA 
block cleavage of the PRL molecule by proteases? This 
journal provides the ideal framework for communicating 
any work on these subjects. A set of recommended lit-
erature is presented in Table 1. Submit your manuscript, 
or find out more about Communications in Prolactin 
Research here: https://www.communications-in-prolac-
tin-research.com/
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